14/08/2008 13:56:44 Remedy Application Service

Email from: b.hoskins@imperial.ac.uk 

Subject: RE: Just to check... - CNTCT#000266 

Fine  Brian

-----Original Message-----

From: impsrequests@reading.ac.uk [mailto:impsrequests@reading.ac.uk] 

Sent: 14 August 2008 13:41

To: Hoskins, Brian J

Cc: b.j.hoskins@reading.ac.uk

Subject: Just to check... - CNTCT#000266

IMPS Request IMPS#00217 CNTCT#000266

When responding to this message, please use your email system reply and

do not alter the subject line, since we need to use the details to

process your response. Thank you

   Brian

   I realise we agreed that I would take matters forward with regard to

completing this FOI case, but I just wanted to make sure we get our

response completely accurate and no unintentional errors crept in. As

such, could you read over my responses to the requester's first 3

questions below please and check that it is correct?

   (a) You provided some 10 electronic documents attached to your email.

All have the same file date of 2 June 2008 although the documents are

dated between 27 June 2006 and 29 November 2006. For instance you

disclosed the email reminder, sent on 29 November 2006, for Professor

Hoskins' Review Editor's report, but not the rather more interestingly

phrased original request for it, sent by email on 13 November. One

particular email, you have disclosed, was received 3 July 2006, the same

day as the Manning document was emailed to all reviewers and, I presume,

Review Editors, but you claim not to hold it. Is it your position that

these 10 are the sum total of the relevant documents that you now hold

with the exception of personal information about myself? Are there no

other documents for which you are claiming exemptions? 

   I can confirm that the University holds no more relevant documents to

your request of 5th May 2008 than those that you have already been

provided with or that I have already communicated to you in our

correspondence. 

   (b) In your email of 8 July 2008 you now say however, "Professor

Hoskins confirms that he did receive the Manning document as referred to

above, however he no longer holds any correspondence that references the

document or the material in it in any way." 

   Am I to understand from this that Professor Hoskins selectively

deleted emails pertaining to his work as an IPCC Review Editor? 

   There have been no deletions of any correspondence that references

the Manning document or material in it in any way. 

   (c) If the answer to (b) is affirmative, please can you tell me the

date these deletions occurred? 

   This information is not held by virtue of the answer to (b).

   Many thanks, Lee

14/08/2008 13:48:00 vis04ls2

Brian phoned at 12.45pm and we discussed the case. I sent him a draft (below) of the position for him to confirm.

14/08/2008 13:39:38 vis04ls2

Email sent to b.hoskins@imperial.ac.uk b.j.hoskins@reading.ac.uk; 

Subject: Just to check... 

Brian

I realise we agreed that I would take matters forward with regard to completing this FOI case, but I just wanted to make sure we get our response completely accurate and no unintentional errors crept in. As such, could you read over my responses to the requester's first 3 questions below please and check that it is correct?

(a) You provided some 10 electronic documents attached to your email. All have the same file date of 2 June 2008 although the documents are dated between 27 June 2006 and 29 November 2006. For instance you disclosed the email reminder, sent on 29 November 2006, for Professor Hoskins' Review Editor's report, but not the rather more interestingly phrased original request for it, sent by email on 13 November. One particular email, you have disclosed, was received 3 July 2006, the same day as the Manning document was emailed to all reviewers and, I presume, Review Editors, but you claim not to hold it. Is it your position that these 10 are the sum total of the relevant documents that you now hold with the exception of personal information about myself? Are there no other documents for which you are claiming exemptions? 

I can confirm that the University holds no more relevant documents to your request of 5th May 2008 than those that you have already been provided with or that I have already communicated to you in our correspondence. 

(b) In your email of 8 July 2008 you now say however, "Professor Hoskins confirms that he did receive the Manning document as referred to above, however he no longer holds any correspondence that references the document or the material in it in any way." 

Am I to understand from this that Professor Hoskins selectively deleted emails pertaining to his work as an IPCC Review Editor? 

There have been no deletions of any correspondence that references the Manning document or material in it in any way. 

(c) If the answer to (b) is affirmative, please can you tell me the date these deletions occurred? 

This information is not held by virtue of the answer to (b).

Many thanks, Lee

Chase date set to 21/08/08 13:39:38

14/08/2008 11:49:16 vis04ls2

Email sent to b.hoskins@imperial.ac.uk b.j.hoskins@reading.ac.uk; 

Subject: ...additionally 

Dear Brian

Sorry, I meant to say, could you ring me before noon tomorrow (Friday 15th August)? If you have to ring out of office hours, feel free to use my mobile phone number - 07758 617525.

Best wishes, Lee

Chase date set to 21/08/08 11:49:16

14/08/2008 11:47:58 vis04ls2

Email sent to b.hoskins@imperial.ac.uk b.j.hoskins@reading.ac.uk; 

Subject: FOI request 

Dear Brian

Would you be able to ring me please on 0118 378 8981 please? The matter is of some urgency, but the phone call should not take longer than 10minutes. 

Best wishes, Lee

Chase date set to 21/08/08 11:47:58

15/07/2008 11:27:44 Remedy Application Service

Email from: b.j.hoskins 

Subject: Re: Further FOI requests - CNTCT#000266 

Dear Lee I have made enquiries and found that both the MetOffice/MOD and 

UEA are resisting the FOI requests made by Holland. The latter are very 

relevant to us as UK universities should speak with the same voice on this. 

I gather that they are using academic freedom as their reason. I have been 

given the name of the person who is dealing with this matter at UEA. It is: 

REDACTED University of East Anglia Norwich, 

England NR4 7TJ I urge you to contact him so that we can get our act 

together. Best wishes Brian
14/07/2008 15:49:42 vis04ls2

Email sent to b.hoskins@imperial.ac.uk b.j.hoskins@reading.ac.uk; 

Subject: Further FOI requests 

Dear Brian 

We have received further requests for information under the Freedom of Information Act (FOIA) and the University is required to provide this information unless any exemptions apply.

I have attached the requests which explains what information is being asked for, and I would be grateful if you could call me by 21/07/2008 to let me know how you wish to proceed and to discuss our response. Use my mobile number - 07758 617525 - as I will be out of the office for much of the week. If you have difficulty meeting this deadline, or have no information, please could you let me know as soon as possible. Under the FOIA we are obliged to fulfil the request within 20 working days.

If you have reservations about sending what you believe to be sensitive data or if you require any further information please contact our office for guidance. 

Kind regards,

Lee

--------------------

Lee Shailer

Administrator

IMPS (Information Management & Policies Services)

University of Reading

Room 217, Whiteknights House

Reading, RG6 6AH

e: imps@reading.ac.uk or l.shailer@reading.ac.uk

t: 0118 378 8981

f: 0118 931 4404

w: www.reading.ac.uk/foia 

ATTACHMENTS:
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